



Final Bid Tabulation May 22, 2018

IFB 18-004/KJS One New and One Used Pad-FootVibratory Drum Vibratory Roller for JCDD6

| | Description | Quantity | Unit Price | Warranty Price | Total Price/ Unit | Delivery Date | Manufacturer | Buyback | | |
|--|----------------------|----------|--------------------------|-------------------------------|--------------------------|---------------|------------------|---------|--------------|----------|
| | | | | | | | | 3-year | 4-year | 5-year |
| Mustang CAT 7990 Eastex Freeway Beaumont, Texas 77708 Phone: 409-201-9500 Contact: Stevan DeLeon sdeleone@mustangcat.com | New Pad Foot Roller | 1 | \$ 154,300.00 | \$ - | \$ 154,300.00 | 2-3 weeks | CAT | 3-year | \$ 83,000.00 | 3000 hr. |
| | | | | | | | | 4-year | \$ 73,000.00 | 4000 hr. |
| | | | | | | | | 5-year | \$ 61,000.00 | 5000 hr. |
| | Used Pad Foot Roller | 1 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| Associated Supply Co. Inc. ASCO 5980 MLK PKWY Beaumont, Texas 77705 Phone: 409-212-8100 Contact: Don Norton don@ascoeq.com | New Pad Foot Roller | 1 | \$ 124,500.00 | \$ - | \$ 124,500.00 | 45 Days | CASE | 3-year | No Bid | No Bid |
| | | | | | | | | 4-year | | |
| | | | | | | | | 5-year | | |
| | Used Pad Foot Roller | 1 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | 3-year | No Bid |
| Waukesha Pearce 8903 Hwy 69 South Port Arthur, Texas 77640 Phone: 409-721-5305 Contact: Ryan Pyburn pyburn@wpi.com | New Pad Foot Roller | 1 | \$ 169,800.00 | \$ 8,000.00 | \$ 177,800.00 | 90Days | Bomag | 3-year | No Bid | No Bid |
| | | | | | | | | 4-year | | |
| | | | | | | | | 5-year | | |
| | Used Pad Foot Roller | 1 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | 3-year | No Bid |
| Doggett Heavy Machinery 4355 W. Cardinal Drive Beaumont, Texas 77705 Phone: 409-842-1754 Contact: Charlie Cotton charlie.cotton@doggett.com | New Pad Foot Roller | 1 | \$ 116,500.00 | \$ 5,659.00 | \$ 122,159.00 | 10-12 Weeks | Dynapac CA2500PD | 3-year | No Bid | No Bid |
| | | | | | | | | 4-year | | |
| | | | | | | | | 5-year | | |
| | Used Pad Foot Roller | 1 | \$ 114,250.00 | -Remaining 36 Months 3000 hr. | \$ 114,250.00 | 3 Weeks | Dynapac CA2500PD | 3-year | No Bid | No Bid |
| | | | | | | | | 4-year | | |
| | | | | | | | | 5-year | | |