(IFB 17-001/KJS Term Contract for Tires for Light and Heavy Duty Vehicles and Equipment
Preliminary Tab- March 9, 2017

American Tire Distribution
350 Railhead Road

GCR Tires and Service
5555 College St.

Goodyear
200 Inovation Way

Southern Tire Mart
800 Highway 98

Fort Worth, Texas 76106 Beaumont, Texas 77707 Akron Ohio, 443160001 Columbia, MS 39429
Phone: Phone: Phone: Phone: 601-424-3239
Contact: Contact: Contact: Rick Bevington Contact: Lynn Hayden
Manufacturer/ Manufacturer/ Manufacturer/ Manufacturer/
Item Tire Description Model/Brand Tread Pattern Price Per Unit Model/Brand Tread Pattern Price Per Unit Model/Brand Tread Pattern Price Per Unit Model/Brand Tread Pattern Price Per Unit
LIGHT TRUCK, AUTO, SUV LIGHT TRUCK, AUTO, SUV LIGHT TRUCK, AUTO, SUV LIGHT TRUCK, AUTO, SUV
BS Dueler AT Rev02 $ 114.85 f b
Fil Destinati irest tinati
1 P255/70R16/10 PLY "eswneLE;St'"a“o" Highway $ 110.69 FS Dest. LE2 Highway s 11411 No Bid No Bid No Bid res °"eLEZeS fnation Highway $ 112.00
HK Dynapro HT $ 120.86
BS Dueler AT Revo2 $ 173.64
Direstone Destination . . Goodyear Wrangler . . .
2 LT265/75R16/10 PLY AT All Terrain $ 122.96 ES Dest. LE2 All Terrain $ 126.76 Trail Runner All Terrain $ 138.75 | Firestone Transforce AT All Terrain S 124.00
HK Dynapro ATM $ 161.13
FS Dest MT $ 15293 e Wrangl Firestone Destinati
) - ) . oodyear Wrangler . irestone Destination )
3 LT265/75R16/10 PLY Firestone Destination MT| Mud Tire S 148.34 HK Dynapro MT Mud Tire 13 228.76 Armortrac Mud Tire S 143.86 M/T Mud Tire S 150.00
Kenda KR29 MT S 149.10
Firestone Destination . BS Dueler HL422 . S 158.82 . Firestone Destination .
4 P245/65R17/6 PLY Highwa 95.32 Highwa Goodyear Wrangler SRA Highwa 120.59 Highwa S 96.00
/ / LE2 8 v $ FS Dest LE2 € v S 98.27 v € € v $ LE2 8 v
HK Dynapro RH 12 S 133.00
. P BS Dueler HT684 S 151.62 . P
Firestone Destination Firestone Destination .
5 P255/70R17/6 PLY Highway S 110.54 Highway Goodyear Wrangler SRA Highway S 122.73 Highway S 111.00
LE2 FS Dest. LE2 s 11396 | e LE2
HK Dynapro RH12 S 167.04
i . Wi I . .
6 LT235/80R17/10 PLY Firestone Transforce AT All Terrain $ 119.63 BS Blizzack W965 All Terrain s 23181 Goody?ar rangler All Terrain $ 141.61 | Firestone Transforce AT All Terrain $ 121.00
FS Transforce AT S 123.33 Trail Runner
HK Dynapro ATM S 176.88
. Wi (| . .
7 LT245/75R17/10 PLY Firestone Transforce AT All Terrain $ 120.92 BS Dueler AT Revo2 All Terrain s 129.28 Goody?ar rangier All Terrain $ 139.06 | Firestone Transforce AT All Terrain $ 122.00
FS Transforce AT S 124.66 Trail Runner
HK Dynapro ATM S 181.03
. 3 Wi | . ial Di "
8 LT245/75R17/10 PLY Goodyear Wrangler Mud Tire $ 175.79 |Nitto EXO Grappler Mud Tire 5 227.71 | Goodyear Wrangler Mud Tire $ 152.60 Centennial Dirt Mud Tire $ 120.54
MTR Cooper Discoverer SK S 227.24 Armortrac Commander MT
Toyo Open Country C/T S 225.05
BS Dueler AT Revo2 5 14943 Goodyear Wrangler Firestone Transforce
9 LT265/70R17/10 PLY Firestone Transforce AT All Terrain $ 133.27 FS Transforce AT All Terrain S 137.39 T y’l R s All Terrain $ 146.01 AT All Terrain $ 128.00
raill Runner
HK Dynapro ATM S 144.09
Firestone Transforce CT Terrain Contact AT 5 260.61 Goodyear Wrangler Firestone Transforce
10 LT265/70R18/10 PLY All Terrain $ 187.17 HK Dynapro ATM All Terrain S 250.00 y‘ s All Terrain $ 161.60 All Terrain $ 147.00
AT2 - Trail Runner AT2
Nitto Terra Grappler G2 S 241.00
HEAVY TRUCK HEAVY TRUCK HEAVY TRUCK HEAVY TRUCK
BS R238 $ 287.44 Dunlop SP348 $ 222.26
1 245/70R19.5/14 PLY Firestone FS560+ Steering FS FS560 Plus Steering $ 228.50 Steering Firestone FS561 Steering S 229.00
Goodyear G647
$ 221.65 HK AH11 $ 281.25 $ 255.00
BS M729F
) ) ) s 334.76 Dunlop SP461 ) $ 239.73 ) )
2 245/70R19.5/16 PLY Firestone FS690+ Traction $ 235.92 DT D630 Traction $ 250.00 Traction Bridgestone M729F Traction $ 329.00
CT HDR S 402.00 Goodyear G622 S 265.00
HK AH11TT s 432.93
bl . . 32018 s . No Bid s . No Bid Road One All Position Steeri s 287.00
3 10.00R20/16 PLY Double Coin RR150 Steering S . Kumho KRS02 TT teering $ 388.68 o Bi teering o Bi LLFOG eering Rk




Samson GL274ATT S 353.49
HK AH11TT s 493.00
4 11.00R20/16 PLY Goodyear G287 Steering S 450.02 Steering Goodyear G287 Steering S 450.00 ECED BT168 Hwy Steering S 400.00
Thunderer RA401 TT 3 380.16
BS R250ED
5 11R22.5/16 PLY Firestone F$561 Steering $ 303.82 STesel Steering z :iig G°°dvea’;‘sND°rkh°rse Steering $ 360.00 | Firestone FS561 Steering $ 308.00
HK AH24 S 395.66
BS M799
6 11R24.5/16 PLY Firestone FD663 Traction s 33352 Traction s 41042 | Goodyear Workhorse Traction $ 375.00 Firestone T831 Traction $ 372.00
FST831 S 377.74 MSD
Samson GL992A S 396.88
BS R250ED
7 11R24.5/16 PLY Firestone FS561 s 336.37 Steering s 450.65 | Goodyear Workhorse Steering $ 400.00 Firestone FS561 Steering $ 340.00
FS FS561 S 345.00 MSA
Steering Samson GL 283A S 333.10
BS M795 s 473.65 Goodyear Workhorse
8 11R24.5/16 PLY Firestone FD663 Traction S 355.86 FST831 Traction S 428.74 MSD Traction S 425.00 Firestone T831 Traction S 423.00
Samson GL 909A S 424.80
BS M860A S 579.89
9 315/80R22.5 5 Ply Load Range J Firestone F5820 Steering $ 445.39 FS 7819 Steering 3 445.39 G°°dvea'\r/|‘é‘;°rkh°'se Steering s 440.00 Firestone F$820 Steering $ 449.00
Samason GL665A S 500.19
BS R250 ED $ 319.00 Dunlop SP160 $ 268.21
10 255/70R22.5/16 PLY Firestone FS560+ Steering S 264.06 FSFS 561 Steering s 302.48 | Goodyear Endurance Steering s 300,00 Firestone FS560 Steering S 267.00
Samson GL283A S 237.94 RsA
BS M854 S 599.15 Dunlop SP231 S 500.00
11 385/65R22.5/18 PLY Firestone T839 Steering S 446.06 FS T839 Steering $ 455.16 Goodyear G296 Steering S 599.37 Firestone T839 Steering $ 450.00
Samson GL 689A S 404.08
BS M860A S 701.67 Dunlop SP281 S 550.00
12 425/65R22.5/20 PLY Firestone T839 Steering $ 509.15 FS T839 Steering S 516.90 Goodyear G296 Steering s 665.97 Firestone T839 Steering $ 511.00
Samson GL 689A S 430.00
BS M854 $ 765.68
13 445/65R22.5/20 PLY Firestone T839 Steering $ 556.96 FS T839 Steering S 565.44 Goodyear G296 Steering $ 712.58 Firestone T839 Steering S 560.00
Samson GL 689A $ 595.71
TRAILER TRAILER TRAILER TRAILER
Carlisle USA Trailer S 47.94
1 4.80-12 Carlisle Sport Trail NA S 22.25 Carlisle Sport Trailer S 29.75 Titan ST Sport Trax NA S 48.37 Hi-Run Trailer Su02 S 44,00
Hi Run Trailer NA S 23.68
Carlisle USA Trailer S 52.48
2 5.30-12 Carlisle Sport Trail NA S 27.03 Carlisle Sport Trailer S 32.78 Titan ST Sport Trax NA S 68.26 Hi-Run Trailer Su02 S 47.00
Hi Run Trailer NA S 26.65
Carlisle USA Trailer S 71.05
3 ST 205/75/14 STC Hi Run NA S 40.20 Carlisle Sport Trailer S 57.94 | Goodyear Marathon NA S 59.81 Noble NB809 S 57.00
Hi Run Trailer NA S 44.96
4 7.00-15 Samson Special ST NA $ 62.31 | Carlisle Sport Trailer 5 79.74 No Bid No Bid No Bid Gladiator QR-15 $ 72.00
Road Guider ST NA S 56.30
Master Track ST S 95.03
5 ST 225/75/15 Carlisle Sport Trail NA S 54.72 Carlisle Trailer HD S 88.50 | Goodyear Marathon NA S 70.33 Transporter ST100 S 60.00
Master Track UN203 NA S 53.28
6 7.00R16 Samson RB233 NA S 62.31 Specialty Tire LN TT NA S 152.74 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hercules H-901 Trailer S 149.41
7 7.50R16 STC Hi Run NA S 77.51 Samson Trailer NA S 147.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid Transporter TM100 S 76.00
Hi Run Trailer S 125.18
Carlisle Trailer HD S 96.05
8 ST 235/80R16 STC HiRun NA S 69.63 Hi Run Trailer NA S 80.24 Goodyear Marathon NA S 90.27 Noble NB809 S 74.00
Master Track UN203 S 64.60
BS R238 S 254.42
9 215/75R17.5/16 PLY Firestone FS561 NA S 202.57 FS FS 561 NA S 219.82 Goodyear G114 NA S 300.00 Firestone FS561 Hwy S 203.00
HKTH 22 S 196.20
ATV/UTV ATV/UTV ATV/UTV ATV/UTV
1 AT26X12.00-12 Interco Swamp Lite | Carlisle Mud Wolf [ $ 98.10 |Interco Swamp Lite | NA [s 115.73 [Interco Swamp Lite | No Bid [ No Bid Interco Swamp Lite | Swamp Lite [s 95.00
2 AT27X12.00-12 Interco Swamp Lite | Carlisle Mud Wolf [ $ 119.44 [Interco Swamp Lite | NA [s 124.06 [Interco Swamp Lite | No Bid [ No Bid Interco Swamp Lite | Swamp Lite ['s 101.00

OFFROAD AND EQUIPMENT

OFFROAD AND EQUIPMENT

OFFROAD AND EQUIPMENT

OFFROAD AND EQUIPMENT




1 12.5/80-18 12 PLY Backhoe Firestone Super Trac NA FS Sup Trac LDR I-3 NA s 25389 | fitan Contractor Il NA 362.27 Firestone Super 13 248.00
Solideal R-4 NA S 288.34 Traction
246.27 DS D302 R-4 NA $ 219.80
2 11.2R24 R1 Tractor Firestone SAT Il NA 209.12 |FSSuper ATRL NA 5 215.59 No Bid No Bid No Bid Galaxy R-1 221.00
Continental R1 NA S 268.80
3 12.4-24R1/4 PLY Tractor Firestone SAT Il NA 284,88 |FS Super ATR1 NA s 293.69 | Titan Hi-Traction LUG NA 383.78 Ag-Dura 329 R-1 213.00
Galaxy Earth Pro RIW__|NA s 427.81 R1TLO4
FS Super AT RIW NA $ 69098 | . .
4 12.4-24RI/8 PLY Tractor Firestone SAT II NA 255.11 [BKT RT855 RIW NA $ 439.83 | " HS?SI;“ Lue NA 44033 Galaxy R-1 238.00
Alliance Farm Pro 85
RIW NA $ 386.05
5 14.00-24RI/12 PLY Crane Bridgestone VHS NA 131815 [P SRGG2 NA s 77868 | Goodyear American NA 400.00 Ag-Dura E3/L3 569.00
BKT EM-937 £3 NA s 1,104.79 Miner
OTR Blackstone G2 NA S 514.29
6 9.5-16 RI 6 PLY Tractor Firestone SAT Il NA 152.88 |BKT TR171 R1 NA S 211.08 Titan H;—I?Ltglzon Lue NA 317.74 | Carlisle Farm Specialist R-1 190.00
Carlisle Farm R1 NA S 183.53
7 14.9R24 Rl Tractor Firestone SAT II NA 330,53 [FSPerf 85 RIW NA 5 60187 | Titan Hi-Traction LUG NA 76313 |  Galaxy Earth-Pro R-1 539.00
BKT RT855 RIW NA s 569.00 R1ROAS/B
Galaxy Earth Pro RIW  [NA S 583.93
) ) FS AT Utility R4 NA $ 538.65 ) ! ]
8 19.5124 10 PLY Backhoe Firestone AII Traction NA 53057 [Vizzoni VZ RT 42 Ra NA s 384.45 Goodyear American NA 475.00 Firestone {-\.II Traction R4 533.00
Utility - Backhoe Utility
Galaxy EZ Rider R4 NA S 384.45
BS VMT E3/13 NA $ 1,257.48
9 17.5R-25 L3 Loader Bridgestone RL L-3 NA 848.91 |Triangle TB516 E3/L3 NA S 848.88 | Goodyear GRLDL3A NA 675.00 | Bridgestone VT D2A L-3 1,252.00
Vizzoni E3/13 NA $ 847.23
29.5R25 E3-L3 Articulated D
10 9-5R25 E3-L3 Articulated Dump No Bid NA No Bid BS VMT E3/L3 NA 5 4,680.27 Goodyear RT3B NA 5,000.00 | Bridgestone VMT D2A -3 4,125.00
Truck Advance GL902 E3 NA S 3,267.11
Primex RS300 E3/L3 NA S 3,342.50
Firestone Perf 85
11 16.9R30 R1 Tractor res °"eR ;’N"'mer NA 870.10 |Fs perf 85 R1IW NA s 906.91 | Titan AG 48H RAD RIW NA 1,450.54 |  BKT Agrimax RT855 R-1 521.00
BKT RT 855 R1W NA $ 894.06
FS RAD AT23 R1 NA $ 1,301.38
12 18.4R34 R1 Tractor Firestone 23 R-1 NA 1,084.00 BKT RT855 R1IW NA s 1,007.06 Titan GY DT710 R1 NA 1,145.21 | Titan Hi-Traction Lug R-1 862.00
Alliance Farm Pro 846
RIW NA $ 955.01
13 33.25-35/38 PLY Crane No Bid No Bid No Bid BS VRL E3/L3 NA s 8,937.81 No Bid No Bid No Bid F"Esm”:i”pe' Rock E3 6,588.00
FS SRG E3/L3 NA $ 6,593.58 P
14 18.4R42 Rl Tractor Firestone 23 R-1 NA 1,396.49 ks _RAD R1 NA s 1,455.56 Titan AG 48H RAD R1W NA 1,870.50 Alliance Farm Pro R-1 917.00
Alliance Farm Pro 85 R1 |NA S 988.23
15 | 16.00-25E3 L3 Loader/Forklift | Firestone SRG E-3 NA 1,649.42 [[SSREES/LS NA s L7434 Goodyear HRL3A NA 2,750.00 | Firestone Super Rack E3 1,669.00
Zeemax E3/L3 NA S 1,065.59 Grip
Armpower E3/L3 NA S 1,038.05
16 20.5-25 16 Ply Loader/Dozer | Samson Rock Crusher NA 622.34 [Fs srG E3/13 NA s 1,086.75 | Goodyear GGL DL2A NA 850.00 | Firestone (S;:ipe' Ground L2 996.00
BKT SR30 E3/L3 NA $ 1,649.34 P
17 16.99-28 Rl 6ply Tractor Firestone SAT Il NA 430.75 |FSSuper ATR1 NA s 441.79 | Titan Hi-Traction Lug R1 NA 617.87 Ag-Dura R-1 379.00
BKT AS2001TT R1 NA s 513.51 TLO6
Titan HiTrac NA S 528.99
18 18.4-16 RI 8ply Tractor Firestone Traction Field NA 736.75 FS Tr:ac F&B R1 NA S 747.97 | Titan Hi-Traction Lug R1 764.08 Titan Hi-Traction R-1 487.00
& Road Specialty Tire AF R1 NA S 668.13 TLO8 NA
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