(IFB 15-013/KJS) HDPE Term Contract

FINAL TAB - AUGUST 25, 2015

ACT Pipe & Supply
1405 Ashley Street
Beaumont, Texas 77701
Elijah Daigle
(409) 926-7497
edaigle@actpipe.com

Coburns Supply
1000 Bowie St
Beaumont, Texas 77701
Matt Hebert
(409) 284-4578
mhebert@coburns.com

Coastal Culvert & Supply
P.O. Box 1145
Eunice, LA 70535
Terry Brown
(337) 546-6887
tbrown@coastalculvert.com

Rural Pipe & Supply
P.O. Box 1540
Jasper, Texas 75951
Tommy Shaver
(409) 384-5800

Item Pipe Price Per Price Per Price Per LF Price Per Price Per
No. Diameter Linear Foot Linear Foot  w/2% Discount Linear Foot Linear Foot
1 12.00" $ 4.47 452 | S 4431$ 5.00 | $ 4.61
2 15.00" S 6.60 6.67 | S 6.54 S 7.281$ 6.81
3 18.00" $ 7.92 8.01(S$ 7.851$ 881]S$ 8.17
4 24.00" S 14.28 14.43 | S 14.14 1 S 15.881$ 14.73
5 30.00" $ 22.75 2298 | S 2252 1S 25.27 | $ 23.40
6 36.00" S 26.08 26.36 | S 25.83 1 $ 30.00 | $ 26.91
7 42.00" S 36.67 37.07 | S 36.33 S 40.95 | $ 37.85
8 48.00" S 43.42 43.89 | S 43.01 ) $ 48.07 | $ 44.81
9 54.00" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10 60.00" S 81.70 82.58 S 80.93 | $ 92.33 S 84.31
Discount on Payment: N/A 2% Net 10 Days N/A N/A
Est Delivery Time Per Order 3-5 Days 2-3 Days 7 Days 2-4 Days
Manufacturer Bid: ADS/Hancor ADS ADS ADS

Jefferson County Drainage District No. 6 makes no claim that this bid tabulation represents anything other than the information read aloud at the public opening. The

County has not checked the bids for errors, or made nay determinations that the solicitations meet all requirements. In the case of a discrepancy between information on
this tabulating and the original hard-copy document, the original hard copy shall prevail.
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